
Resource, Risk & Estates Committee [COLPAB] –Public Outstanding References 

1/2024/P 5 February 2024 
Item 6- Q3 Budget 
Monitoring 

Corporate Service Model was 
agreed in November 2023, and 
funding streams were being 
realigned to reflect this demand 
and would be profiled into the 
2024-25 budgets. The 
organisational restructure would be 
completed by 31 March 2024, with 
recruitment target for November 
2024. A Member requested an 
update at the next RREC to 
highlight more detail on the 
progress of this work. 

Commissioner Complete- an update on the 

Corporate Services Review 

implementation is included in 

the COO/CFO update on the 

agenda. 

2/2024/P 5 February 2024 
Item 8- Q3 HR 
Monitoring 

Members queried the challenges 
faced by Police in recruiting 
women. It was clarified that the 
number of women in posts had 
increased through the Police uplift 
programme, although challenges 
remained in gender and ethnic 
diversity. It was noted that this was 
a London Wide issue. The Deputy 
Chair requested that a report on 
this topic would be bought to the 
committee in November 2024.  
 

Commissioner In Progress- Due November 

RREC as requested by Chair 

 


